
INTRODUCTION
Street crimes are a ubiquitous phenomenon across 
the world. Street crime can be described as "the 
offences of robbery, attempted robbery, snatching, 
and theft from the person irrespective of location. 
'Snatch thefts' refer to those incidents where an 
offender snatches property away from the victim, 
the force being applied to the property as opposed to 
the person, and the victim being immediately aware 

1of what has happened".  The prevalence of street 
criminality among youth in Pakistan, has been 
triggered by a paralyzed economic institution, 
family management, and attachment with the 
delinquent peer. Moreover, anti-social activities 
severely affect economic growth. 
Meanwhile, criminals also suffer numerous mental 
health consequences of their delinquent lifestyle. 
Many studies across the globe have identified poor 

2,3,4psychological health among young offenders.  
Criminals have a higher frequency of psychiatric 

5problems compared to the general population,  and 
emotional distress could be the outcome of criminal 
behavior and subsequent participation in 

6
delinquent behavior.  Besides, some prior studies 
on youth criminal behavior and mental health 

problems have concluded that the prevalence of 
psychological problems and drug addictions in 
criminals could be the result of an association with 

7,8 criminal behavior.
Likewise, the empirical findings of Dembo and 
Schmeidler have also suggested that  majority of the 
offenders have "attention deficit hyperactivity 
disorder (ADHD)" and psychotic problems as 

9
compared to normal people.   A study reported that 
among criminals 10% had major depression, 4% 
had psychotic illnesses and approximately 65% had 

10a personality disorder.  A more recent study 
pinpointed that nearly 90% of the inmates had 
suffered at least one of the following mental health 
problems: derangement, depression, anxiety, 
schizophrenia, and excessive use of alcohol or 

11
drug.  Moreover, youth participation in antisocial 

4,12
activities leads to severe depression and anxiety.  
However, the pervasiveness of conducted disorder, 
depression, and substance use significantly 
triggered suicidal behavior among young 

13,14
offenders.  There is a dearth of studies reflecting 
the impact of street crimes on the mental health of 
young offenders. The purpose of this study was to 
assess the demographic characteristics and 

Objective: To measure the demographic 
characteristics and association between street 
crimes and its impact on the psychological health 
of youth in Khyber Pakhtunkhaw, Pakistan.
Methodology: This cross sectional survey 
included 300 youth offenders in age brackets of 15 
to 29 years placed in seven jails of the province of 
Khyber Pakhtunkhwa. Statistical analysis was 
performed using SPSS 25. Uni-Variate analysis 
was conducted to measures the frequency and 
percentage distribution of the respondent's 
responses.
Results: A highly significant association was found 
between participation in street crimes and offender 
stress as the value of Chi-square shows 36.279 

highly significant at a 1% level of significance. 
Similarly, engagement in street crimes significantly 
determined aggressive behavior among offenders 
as the value of Chi-square revealed 34.688 highly 
significant at a 1% level of significance. 
Involvement in street crimes significantly 
contributed to prevalence of depression among 
offenders as the Chi-secure value shows 14.118 
significantly at a 5% level of significance.  
Conclusion: Street crimes is associated with a 
consequent increase of stress, depression, and 
aggression among youth offenders. (Rawal Med J 
202;45:938-942).
Keywords: Street crimes, offences, mental 
health. 
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association between street crimes and its impact on 
the psychological health of youth in Khyber 
Pakhtunkhaw, Pakistan.

METHODOLOGY
This cross-sectional survey included 300 youth 
offenders having the age brackets of 15 to 29 years, 

15
as defined by the UN.  The sampled youth were 
approached were placed in seven jails of the 
province. The sample was selected from the total 
population of 1200 as per the criteria formulated by 

16
Yamane.  A prior permission of the Prison 
Department of province of KP was sought and an 
informed consent was obtained from all subjects for 
the interview with them. During this, no unethical 
questions were raised and no unnecessary matter 
was discussed with them. The proportional sample 
allocation method was used to determine the sample 
size for each selected jail. The formula for this 
application is mentioned below: 

n  =  Required sample size of street criminals,
N = Total Population of street criminals in selected 

jails,
st

Ni = Number of street criminals in I  stratum,
ni = Sample Size of street criminals to be selected 

stfrom I  stratum
Statistical Analysis: Statistical analysis was 
performed using SPSS version 25. Uni-Variate 
analysis was conducted to measures the frequency 
and percentage distribution of the respondent's 
responses. Correlation analysis and Chi-square tests 
were used to predict the association between 
independent variable i.e. Street crimes, and 
dependent variable e.g. psychological impact.

RESULTS
Table 1 shows jails surveyed. We found that 26.7% 
inmates were literate and 20.3% had a matric level 
of qualification. Most (82%) inmates were 
unmarried and 53.0% reported their family monthly 
income below 20,000. Majority (81.7%) of the 
inmates were arrested for the 1st time and mobile, 
wallet, and gold snatched was the most common 
offense (61.6%), followed by vehicle-related theft 
(23%) (Table 2).

Table 1. Street criminals taken from each jail.

Table 2. Demographic profile of street criminal. 
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A highly significant association was found 
between participation in street crimes and offender 
stress as the value of Chi-square shows 36.279 
highly significant at a 1% level of significance. 
S imi l a r ly,  engagemen t  i n  s t r ee t  c r imes 
significantly determined aggressive behavior 
among offenders as the value of Chi-square 
revealed 34.688 highly significant at a 1 % level of 
significance. Pearson's correlation analysis was 
used to confirm the relationship of predictor 
variables. Street crimes were significantly 
correlating with the offender's mental health 
problems (stress, depression & aggression) at a 
0.01 level of significance (Table 3). Same results 
were also found at the bivariate level. Association 
between street crimes and psychological impact is 
shown in Table 4.  
   
DISCUSSION
This study contributes to the existing literature gap, 
where minimal empirical studies have been done on 
the psychological impact of offending behavior in 
youth.  Farrington's study found that delinquent 
behavior tends to upsurge at a young age and decline 

19
gradually thereafter.  Other research findings in 
Pakistan also show that there is an inventible link 
between low education, low income, and street 

20crimes.  
This study further explored that goods/mobile 
snatching was the most common offense (61.6%), 
followed by vehicle-related theft (23%) among the 
respondents. Our results pertaining to psychological 
problems and amplify prior research demonstrating 
that youth in imprisonment are severely exposed to 

21,22,23
poor mental health.  
A recent study in Pakistan reconfirmed that youth in 
jails severely faced psychological problems i.e. 

24depression, anxiety, stress etc.  Interestingly, the 
findings as a whole recommend that participation in 
street crimes contributes to stress, depression, and 
aggression as major health problems in youth 
involved in delinquent behavior. 

CONCLUSION 
Participation in street crimes is associated with a 
consequent increase of stress, depression, and 
aggression among youth offenders. 
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